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This remarkable work features the Crimean War as depicted by the late Victorian military writer James
Grant. The material?here was first published in 1894, only 40 years after the end of the Crimean War, at a
time when many of the participants were?still in their sixties. Grant therefore had access to the primary
source interviews which are now lost forever.??Originally published as part of the Cassell's series “British
Battles on Land and Sea”, it presents the reader with an intriguing insight into how contemporary writers
addressed their subject. They say the past is another country and that is certainly true in this instance.??The
contrast between the contemporary Victorian view and the modern view reveals the huge gulf in attitudes.
Mr. Grant's work is clearly 'of its time' and reflects the attitudes of the day which were unashamedly
xenophobic, jingoistic and militaristic. It nonetheless repays the reader as it provides us with a unique
window on the past and brings the long lost world of Victorian Imperialism into focus.
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From reader reviews:

Theresa Walker:

The book untitled The Crimean War (Military History from Primary Sources) is the reserve that
recommended to you to learn. You can see the quality of the book content that will be shown to you actually.
The language that publisher use to explained their way of doing something is easily to understand. The copy
writer was did a lot of exploration when write the book, and so the information that they share for your
requirements is absolutely accurate. You also can get the e-book of The Crimean War (Military History from
Primary Sources) from the publisher to make you a lot more enjoy free time.

Peter Singleton:

Is it you who having spare time after that spend it whole day by watching television programs or just laying
on the bed? Do you need something new? This The Crimean War (Military History from Primary Sources)
can be the response, oh how comes? The new book you know. You are so out of date, spending your free
time by reading in this new era is common not a geek activity. So what these publications have than the
others?

Cheri Tow:

As we know that book is very important thing to add our understanding for everything. By a reserve we can
know everything you want. A book is a pair of written, printed, illustrated or even blank sheet. Every year
has been exactly added. This book The Crimean War (Military History from Primary Sources) was filled
about science. Spend your free time to add your knowledge about your technology competence. Some people
has different feel when they reading a book. If you know how big advantage of a book, you can truly feel
enjoy to read a publication. In the modern era like right now, many ways to get book that you just wanted.

Jessica Harris:

A lot of guide has printed but it differs. You can get it by world wide web on social media. You can choose
the best book for you, science, amusing, novel, or whatever by searching from it. It is known as of book The
Crimean War (Military History from Primary Sources). Contain your knowledge by it. Without causing the
printed book, it could add your knowledge and make anyone happier to read. It is most important that, you
must aware about publication. It can bring you from one place to other place.
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