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“For if you believed Moses, you would believe me; for he wrote of me.”
(John 5:46)

Jesus's declaration frames this study of four books of the Pentateuch—Exodus, Leviticus, Numbers and
Deuteronomy—as we discover the many ways that Moses wrote about Christ. Seasoned Bible teacher Nancy
Guthrie shows that the Bible's story from beginning to end is the story of the Lamb—the Lamb of God who
takes away the sin of the world.

Over ten weeks of guided personal bible study, relevant teaching, and group discussion, you will see the
person and work of Christ:

in the person of Moses as a great deliverer, mediator, and prophet;●

in the manna, the water from the rock, and the bronze serpent on the pole;●

and in the priesthood, tabernacle, and sacrificial system.●

Gain a fresh perspective on the story of Israel's deliverance and journey, a broader understanding of Jesus as
the fulfillment of Scripture, and much more, when you join with Nancy on this incredible journey to see
Jesus in the Old Testament!

* A leader's guide is available as a free download at SeeingJesusInTheOldTestament.com and a
supplemental DVD of Nancy’s teaching is also available for purchase.
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From reader reviews:

Hector Naranjo:

Here thing why this The Lamb of God (A 10-week Bible Study): Seeing Jesus in Exodus, Leviticus,
Numbers, and Deuteronomy (Seeing Jesus in the Old Testament) are different and reputable to be yours.
First of all studying a book is good however it depends in the content of it which is the content is as delicious
as food or not. The Lamb of God (A 10-week Bible Study): Seeing Jesus in Exodus, Leviticus, Numbers, and
Deuteronomy (Seeing Jesus in the Old Testament) giving you information deeper since different ways, you
can find any e-book out there but there is no reserve that similar with The Lamb of God (A 10-week Bible
Study): Seeing Jesus in Exodus, Leviticus, Numbers, and Deuteronomy (Seeing Jesus in the Old Testament).
It gives you thrill reading through journey, its open up your eyes about the thing that happened in the world
which is perhaps can be happened around you. It is possible to bring everywhere like in playground, café, or
even in your technique home by train. Should you be having difficulties in bringing the imprinted book
maybe the form of The Lamb of God (A 10-week Bible Study): Seeing Jesus in Exodus, Leviticus, Numbers,
and Deuteronomy (Seeing Jesus in the Old Testament) in e-book can be your option.

Lucas Florio:

The particular book The Lamb of God (A 10-week Bible Study): Seeing Jesus in Exodus, Leviticus,
Numbers, and Deuteronomy (Seeing Jesus in the Old Testament) will bring that you the new experience of
reading some sort of book. The author style to explain the idea is very unique. Should you try to find new
book to read, this book very appropriate to you. The book The Lamb of God (A 10-week Bible Study):
Seeing Jesus in Exodus, Leviticus, Numbers, and Deuteronomy (Seeing Jesus in the Old Testament) is much
recommended to you to learn. You can also get the e-book in the official web site, so you can quickly to read
the book.

Bertram Staten:

Playing with family in the park, coming to see the ocean world or hanging out with pals is thing that usually
you might have done when you have spare time, after that why you don't try factor that really opposite from
that. Just one activity that make you not sense tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller coaster you
already been ride on and with addition associated with. Even you love The Lamb of God (A 10-week Bible
Study): Seeing Jesus in Exodus, Leviticus, Numbers, and Deuteronomy (Seeing Jesus in the Old Testament),
it is possible to enjoy both. It is fine combination right, you still want to miss it? What kind of hang-out type
is it? Oh occur its mind hangout men. What? Still don't buy it, oh come on its named reading friends.

Ross Adams:

Can you one of the book lovers? If so, do you ever feeling doubt while you are in the book store? Try and
pick one book that you just dont know the inside because don't judge book by its cover may doesn't work at
this point is difficult job because you are frightened that the inside maybe not seeing that fantastic as in the



outside appear likes. Maybe you answer is usually The Lamb of God (A 10-week Bible Study): Seeing Jesus
in Exodus, Leviticus, Numbers, and Deuteronomy (Seeing Jesus in the Old Testament) why because the
great cover that make you consider with regards to the content will not disappoint you actually. The inside or
content will be fantastic as the outside or cover. Your reading sixth sense will directly direct you to pick up
this book.
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