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For most of the twentieth century, the most critical concerns of national security have been balance of power
politics and the global arms race. The attacks of September 11, 2001 and the motives behind them, however,
demand a radical break with this tradition. If the United States is to prevail in its long-term contest with
extremist Islam, it will need to re-examine old assumptions, expand the scope of its thinking to include
religion and other "irrational" factors, and be willing to depart from past practice. A purely military response
in reaction to such attacks will simply not suffice. What will be required is a long-term strategy of cultural
engagement, backed by a deeper understanding of how others view the world and what is important to them.
In non-Western cultures, religion is a primary motivation for political actions. Historically dismissed by
Western policymakers as a divisive influence, religion in fact has significant potential for overcoming the
obstacles that lead to paralysis and stalemate. The incorporation of religion as part of the solution to such
problems is as simple as it is profound. It is long overdue.
This book looks at five intractable conflicts and explores the possibility of drawing on religion as a force for
peace. It builds upon the insights of Religion, the Missing Dimension of Statecraft (OUP,1994)--which
examined the role that religious or spiritual factors can play in preventing or resolving conflict--while
achieving social change based on justice and reconciliation. The world-class authors writing in this volume
suggest how the peacemaking tenets of five major world religions can be strategically applied in ongoing
conflicts in which those religions are involved. Finally, the commonalities and differences between these
religions are examined with an eye toward further applications in peacemaking and conflict resolution.
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From reader reviews:

Jessica Bradsher:

Hey guys, do you desires to finds a new book to read? May be the book with the title Faith-Based
Diplomacy: Trumping Realpolitik suitable to you? The book was written by renowned writer in this era. The
book untitled Faith-Based Diplomacy: Trumping Realpolitikis a single of several books that everyone read
now. This particular book was inspired a number of people in the world. When you read this guide you will
enter the new dimensions that you ever know previous to. The author explained their strategy in the simple
way, thus all of people can easily to comprehend the core of this book. This book will give you a lots of
information about this world now. To help you to see the represented of the world with this book.

Evan Hinson:

Reading a guide tends to be new life style on this era globalization. With reading through you can get a lot of
information that could give you benefit in your life. Having book everyone in this world could share their
idea. Books can also inspire a lot of people. Many author can inspire all their reader with their story or
maybe their experience. Not only the storyplot that share in the textbooks. But also they write about the data
about something that you need case in point. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach your young
ones, there are many kinds of book that you can get now. The authors on this planet always try to improve
their talent in writing, they also doing some study before they write to the book. One of them is this Faith-
Based Diplomacy: Trumping Realpolitik.

Jose German:

Can you one of the book lovers? If so, do you ever feeling doubt when you find yourself in the book store?
Attempt to pick one book that you never know the inside because don't ascertain book by its include may
doesn't work the following is difficult job because you are scared that the inside maybe not while fantastic as
in the outside appearance likes. Maybe you answer may be Faith-Based Diplomacy: Trumping Realpolitik
why because the excellent cover that make you consider about the content will not disappoint a person. The
inside or content is definitely fantastic as the outside or even cover. Your reading sixth sense will directly
make suggestions to pick up this book.

John Parish:

This Faith-Based Diplomacy: Trumping Realpolitik is great book for you because the content which is full of
information for you who always deal with world and possess to make decision every minute. This specific
book reveal it data accurately using great plan word or we can point out no rambling sentences inside it. So if
you are read that hurriedly you can have whole information in it. Doesn't mean it only provides you with
straight forward sentences but hard core information with wonderful delivering sentences. Having Faith-
Based Diplomacy: Trumping Realpolitik in your hand like getting the world in your arm, info in it is not
ridiculous one. We can say that no e-book that offer you world with ten or fifteen second right but this
reserve already do that. So , this is good reading book. Heya Mr. and Mrs. occupied do you still doubt that
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