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This volume provides, for the first time, multidisciplinary perspectives on the problem of awareness of
deficits following brain injury. Such deficits may involve perception, attention, memory, language, or motor
functions, and they can seriously disrupt an individual's ability to function. However, some brain-damaged
patients are entirely unaware of the existence or severity of their deficits, even when they are easily noticed
by others. In addressing these topics, contributors cover the entire range of neuropsychological syndromes in
which problems with awareness of deficit are observed: hemiplegia and hemianopia, amnesia, aphasia,
traumatic head injury, dementia, and others. On the clinical side, leading researchers delineate the
implications of awareness of deficits for rehabilitation and patient management, and the role of defense
mechanisms such as denial. Theoretical discussions focus on the importance of awareness disturbances for
better understanding such cognitive processes as attention, consciousness, and monitoring.
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From reader reviews:

Evelina Soria:

Have you spare time for a day? What do you do when you have far more or little spare time? That's why, you
can choose the suitable activity for spend your time. Any person spent their spare time to take a stroll,
shopping, or went to the Mall. How about open or even read a book titled Awareness of Deficit after Brain
Injury: Clinical and Theoretical Issues? Maybe it is to get best activity for you. You recognize beside you
can spend your time along with your favorite's book, you can wiser than before. Do you agree with their
opinion or you have some other opinion?

Shirley Demers:

As people who live in the modest era should be up-date about what going on or facts even knowledge to
make these keep up with the era which is always change and move forward. Some of you maybe will
certainly update themselves by studying books. It is a good choice for yourself but the problems coming to
an individual is you don't know what kind you should start with. This Awareness of Deficit after Brain
Injury: Clinical and Theoretical Issues is our recommendation to cause you to keep up with the world. Why,
because book serves what you want and need in this era.

Curtis Monahan:

Nowadays reading books be a little more than want or need but also turn into a life style. This reading
behavior give you lot of advantages. Associate programs you got of course the knowledge your information
inside the book which improve your knowledge and information. The data you get based on what kind of
publication you read, if you want have more knowledge just go with knowledge books but if you want
experience happy read one along with theme for entertaining for example comic or novel. The actual
Awareness of Deficit after Brain Injury: Clinical and Theoretical Issues is kind of book which is giving the
reader unforeseen experience.

Janice Smith:

Don't be worry if you are afraid that this book will certainly filled the space in your house, you can have it in
e-book approach, more simple and reachable. This Awareness of Deficit after Brain Injury: Clinical and
Theoretical Issues can give you a lot of friends because by you considering this one book you have matter
that they don't and make you more like an interesting person. That book can be one of a step for you to get
success. This book offer you information that possibly your friend doesn't recognize, by knowing more than
other make you to be great individuals. So , why hesitate? We need to have Awareness of Deficit after Brain
Injury: Clinical and Theoretical Issues.
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