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Don Carlos Buenaventura, a powerful brujo in his sixth life, practices a benign form of sorcery based on his
motto “Do no harm.” His great powers derive from intensive training in heightened awareness akin to
Eastern yogic disciplines rather than from incantations, spells, or aid from demon allies. He is accidentally
born in 1684 into an aristocratic Catholic family in Mexico City, a social and religious milieu in which his
identity as a brujo, if known, would put him in mortal danger. In repressing any sign that he is other than an
ordinary young man, he forgets both his brujo powers and who he really is. Exiled at nineteen to the remote
frontier town of Santa Fe, New Mexico, he is exposed during the journey northward to wild desert
landscapes that awaken his forgotten powers. In Santa Fe he resumes his conventional persona to protect
what he now recognizes is his true identity and is caught in the tension of trying to live two lives. An arduous
return trip to Mexico City and back further intensifies his brujo powers, leading to many adventures,
including dangerous encounters with an evil sorcerer, an Apache war party, and a woman devotee of an
ancient Aztec goddess, and also stimulates his recall, in dreams, of his brujo training in past lives. A chance
meeting in Mexico City with a woman trained in Tantric spirituality is life-changing, opening him to other
dimensions of consciousness. Returning to Santa Fe, he faces the task of learning to unite his Brujo’s Way
with his new spiritual path.
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From reader reviews:

Jeremy Smith:

The reserve untitled The Brujo's Way: First in the Buenaventura Series is the publication that recommended
to you to study. You can see the quality of the guide content that will be shown to a person. The language
that writer use to explained their ideas are easily to understand. The author was did a lot of investigation
when write the book, to ensure the information that they share for you is absolutely accurate. You also might
get the e-book of The Brujo's Way: First in the Buenaventura Series from the publisher to make you far more
enjoy free time.

Raymond Simmons:

Many people spending their time frame by playing outside along with friends, fun activity having family or
just watching TV the entire day. You can have new activity to invest your whole day by looking at a book.
Ugh, ya think reading a book can actually hard because you have to bring the book everywhere? It all right
you can have the e-book, delivering everywhere you want in your Smartphone. Like The Brujo's Way: First
in the Buenaventura Series which is finding the e-book version. So , why not try out this book? Let's observe.

David Bostick:

This The Brujo's Way: First in the Buenaventura Series is brand new way for you who has curiosity to look
for some information since it relief your hunger info. Getting deeper you into it getting knowledge more you
know or perhaps you who still having tiny amount of digest in reading this The Brujo's Way: First in the
Buenaventura Series can be the light food for you personally because the information inside this kind of
book is easy to get by simply anyone. These books produce itself in the form which can be reachable by
anyone, sure I mean in the e-book form. People who think that in book form make them feel tired even dizzy
this reserve is the answer. So there is no in reading a publication especially this one. You can find actually
looking for. It should be here for you. So , don't miss the idea! Just read this e-book type for your better life
along with knowledge.

Randi Adams:

Reading a reserve make you to get more knowledge from that. You can take knowledge and information
from your book. Book is created or printed or outlined from each source which filled update of news. With
this modern era like right now, many ways to get information are available for anyone. From media social
just like newspaper, magazines, science e-book, encyclopedia, reference book, new and comic. You can add
your knowledge by that book. Ready to spend your spare time to open your book? Or just trying to find the
The Brujo's Way: First in the Buenaventura Series when you necessary it?
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